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Chairman Peterson and Members of the Committee: 

My name is Jake Miller, and I am the executive director of the Working 
Kansas Alliance (WK.A). WK.A is an organization made up of labor 
organizations and non-labor organizations who stand together in support of 
workers' rights. Working Kansans and their families deserve protections for the 
jobs they perform. Especially, employees who tlu-ough the COVID-19 
pandemic made sure that essential packages were still delivered to our families. 
As well as keeping a supply chain that was in high demand still moving. WK.A 
stands in strong opposition to SB 379 due to its attempt to destroy and cut jobs 
of package delivery personnel and truck drivers. 

Under SB 379, the intention is to automate the trucking industry. In 
essence that seems like someone trying to move with the times. However, that 
is simply not the case. Instead, this bill would kill thousands of jobs of hard­
working Kansans. Truck drivers make a good living and ones who have spent 
years in the industry have missed holidays and important time with their 
families. If SB 379 is passed, the Kansas Legislature will be sending the 
message to them of "Thank you for your service but truck drivers really aren't 
that important." 

We strongly urge you to oppose SB 379 and its attempt to undercut truck 
drivers and to kill jobs. Proponents will state that this bill will not hurt jobs, but 
how can that be true. If this bill is passed without a pem1anent human fail safe 
option, the bill will end jobs for the majority of Kansas truckers. At the same 
time, it will put many Kansas drivers at risk. 

Indeed.com states that the average salary of a truck chiver in Kansas is 
$73,593.00. Further a statistic from 2010 shows that Kansas has 69,670 h·uck 
drivers, which is most likely higher in 20221. Further in 2010, it was reported 
that wages to Kansas truck drivers was in excess of $3 Billion. Passage of SB 
379 will put a heavy sh·ain on the Kansas economy and kill thousands of jobs 
in one of Kansas' s most cherished occupations. 

Should the committee have any questions, please do not hesitate to 
reach out. 

Ja 

Executive Director 
Working Kansas Alliance 

1 I have attached the 2010 information to this testimony. 
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